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A copy of the complete audit report, including fi nancial statements and supplemental 
information is on fi le at city hall and is available for public inspection during normal 
business hours.  Any citizen may obtain from city hall a copy of the complete audit 
report, including fi nancial statements and supplemental information for his or her per-
sonal use.  Citizens requesting a personal copy of the city audit report will be charged 
for duplication costs at a rate that shall not exceed twenty-fi ve cents ($0.25) per page.

COUNTY TAXPAYERS NOTICE

This notice is to advise that the last date to pay
your 2024 Montgomery County Property Taxes to
the Montgomery County Sheriff, will be through the
close of business Tuesday, April 15, 2025.  Prop-
erty tax bills will become delinquent after this date.

All delinquent tax bills will then be transferred to
the Montgomery County Clerk for collection.  Once
the bills have been transferred to the County Clerk,
the bills will be subject to additional penalties, in-
terest and fees, which will be added to the total
due.  Additionally, if the bills remain unpaid, they
will be subject to purchase by a third party later in
the summer of 2025.  If this occurs, a substantial
amount of additional fees and interest can be
charged by the third party purchaser.

01 PUBLIC NOTICES
-Invitation to Bid-

Bids will be received via mail to
Montgomery County Board of Edu-
cation, 3400 Indian Mound Drive,
Mt. Sterling, KY 40353, to furnish
the following items for Montgomery
County Schools.
Bid No. 2025-04-03
Item Oil Disposal
Bid No. 2025-04-04
Item Diesel Fuel
All bids must be clearly marked as
Montgomery County Schools Bid
with the appropriate bid number
and item concerned and received
no later than 2:00 p.m., Friday,
April 11, 2025.
The Board of Education reserves
the right to waive defects and infor-
malities in bids, and/or to reject
any or all proposals as may be
deemed to its interest, and to
award by item, combination of
items, or lot.
Bid forms and/or specifications are
available at the Board of Education
office by contacting Rick Culross,
859-497-8760 ext .  6002,
richard.culross@montgomery.ky-
schools.us  or Brittany Wells,
859-497-8760 ext .  6007,
brittany.wells@montgomery.ky-
schools.us

AFFIDAVIT OF HEIRSHIP –
RICHARD L. GRAY ESTATE

Pamela Hall, daughter and Benefi-
cial Heir of Richard L. Gray, de-
ceased (d. May 31, 2002, Pike
County, KY), claims all rights to the
estate. No written will exists—es-
tate passed per family custom.
Heirs: Pamela Hall, Dwayne Gray,
Michelle Gray (children), and
spouse Jeanetta Gray. All estate
property—titles, assets, securities,
etc.—assigned to the RICHARD L.
GRAY Legacy Trust.
Executor: Hall, Pamela.
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COMMONWEALTH
OF KENTUCKY

MENIFEE CIRCUIT COURT
DIVISION I

ACTION NO. 24-CI-90071
ELECTRONICALLY FILED

MOVEMENT MORTGAGE, LLC,
PLAINTIFF

vs.  NOTICE OF
COMMISSIONER’S SALE

CALVIN J. RATLIFF ,ET AL, DE-
FENDANTS
By virtue of a Judgment and Order
of Sale entered in Menifee Circuit
Court on March 27, 2025, to raise
the sum of $68,774.48, plus inter-
est, fees, and the costs of sale, I
will expose for sale to the highest
and best bidder at the Courthouse
door, in Frenchburg, Menifee
County, Kentucky, on Wednesday,
April 30, 2025, at the hour of 11:00
a.m., the following described prop-
erty:
Property Address:  193 Parsons
Lane, Wellington, KY 40387
Parcel No. 071-00-00-003.74
Lot No. 74, Adams Acres Subdivi-
sion, as shown on a survey and
plat of said subdivision of record in
plat book 1, page 81, Menifee
County Clerk’s office, to which ref-
erence is made for a more particu-
lar description and located of said
lot.
Being the same property conveyed
to Calvin J. Ratliff, and unmarried
man, by deed dated 6/26/2020 and
recorded 7/1/2020 in deed book
125, page 252, in the records of
the Menifee County Clerk.
This property is sold subject to all
real estate taxes, easements, and
off-sales of record; and reference
is hereby made to the office of the
Menifee County Clerk.
The terms of the sale shall be ten
(10%) percent cash or check at the
time of sale and the balance on
credit of thirty (30) days with privi-
lege of the successful bidder to
pay in full at the time of sale.  The
successful bidder requesting credit
must execute a bond with ap-
proved surety bearing interest at
the rate of 3.625% per anum from
date of sale until paid, which bond
shall have the full force and effect
of a Judgment and should execu-
tion be issued thereon, no replevy
shall be allowed.  A lien shall exist
and shall be retained by the Com-
missioner on the property sold as
security for the purchase price.

/s/ Howard D. Stone
Hon. Howard Stone,

Master Commissioner
Menifee Circuit Court

Law Office of Howard D. Stone,
PLLC

P.O. Box 712
Owingsville, Kentucky 40360

606-674-9233
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MOVEMENT MORTGAGE, LLC,
PLAINTIFF

vs.  NOTICE OF
COMMISSIONER’S SALE

CALVIN J. RATLIFF ,ET AL, DE-
FENDANTS
By virtue of a Judgment and Order
of Sale entered in Menifee Circuit
Court on March 27, 2025, to raise
the sum of $68,774.48, plus inter-
est, fees, and the costs of sale, I
will expose for sale to the highest
and best bidder at the Courthouse
door, in Frenchburg, Menifee
County, Kentucky, on Wednesday,
April 30, 2025, at the hour of 11:00
a.m., the following described prop-
erty:
Property Address:  193 Parsons
Lane, Wellington, KY 40387
Parcel No. 071-00-00-003.74
Lot No. 74, Adams Acres Subdivi-
sion, as shown on a survey and
plat of said subdivision of record in
plat book 1, page 81, Menifee
County Clerk’s office, to which ref-
erence is made for a more particu-
lar description and located of said
lot.
Being the same property conveyed
to Calvin J. Ratliff, and unmarried
man, by deed dated 6/26/2020 and
recorded 7/1/2020 in deed book
125, page 252, in the records of
the Menifee County Clerk.
This property is sold subject to all
real estate taxes, easements, and
off-sales of record; and reference
is hereby made to the office of the
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The terms of the sale shall be ten
(10%) percent cash or check at the
time of sale and the balance on
credit of thirty (30) days with privi-
lege of the successful bidder to
pay in full at the time of sale.  The
successful bidder requesting credit
must execute a bond with ap-
proved surety bearing interest at
the rate of 3.625% per anum from
date of sale until paid, which bond
shall have the full force and effect
of a Judgment and should execu-
tion be issued thereon, no replevy
shall be allowed.  A lien shall exist
and shall be retained by the Com-
missioner on the property sold as
security for the purchase price.

/s/ Howard D. Stone
Hon. Howard Stone,

Master Commissioner
Menifee Circuit Court

Law Office of Howard D. Stone,
PLLC

P.O. Box 712
Owingsville, Kentucky 40360

606-674-9233

LEGAL NOTICE: IN RE: WELLS
FARGO BANK, N.A. VS. UN-
KNOWN HEIRS, LEGATEES AND
DEVISEES OF GARY LYNN
PIERSAWL, ET AL. Any Heir,
Legatee and Devisee of Gary Lynn
Piersawl will please take notice
that on March 10, 2025, Wells
Fargo Bank, N.A. filed a Foreclo-
sure Complaint in Montgomery Cir-
cuit Court in which the Heirs, Lega-
tees and Devisees of Gary Lynn
Piersawl were named as interested
parties. Any Heir, Legatee and De-
visee of Gary Lynn Piersawl is re-
quired to be made aware of this
action and Jesse R. Hodgson, a
practicing attorney in Mount Ster-
ling, Kentucky, was appointed by
said Court to advise Any Heir,
Legatee and Devisee of Gary Lynn
Piersawl of this action. Any Heir,
Legatee and Devisee of Gary Lynn
Piersawl is given the opportunity to
file any objections to such action or
appear in open Court as sched-
uled. If the event Any Heir, Lega-
tee and Devisee of Gary Lynn
Piersawl fails to respond, the Fore-
closure Complaint may be granted
by said Court and any other relief
requested by Wells Fargo Bank,
N.A. Any Heir, Legatee and Devi-
see of Gary Lynn Piersawl may
contact Jesse R. Hodgson of
White Peck Carrington, LLP, at
P.O. Box 950, Mount Sterling,
Kentucky 40353; at (859)
498-2872; or jhodgson@white-
peckcarrington.com.

01 PUBLIC NOTICES
COMMONWEALTH

OF KENTUCKY
MONTGOMERY CIRCUIT COURT

DIVISION II
ACTION NO. 23-CI-90163

Electronically Filed
CITIBANK, N.A., PLAINTIFF
v.
BRANDI L. DRAGOO, ET. AL.,
DEFENDANTS

NOTICE OF COMMISSIONER’S
SALE

By virtue of a Judgment and Order
of Sale entered in MontgomeryCir-
cuit Court on March 20, 2025, to
raise the sum of $121,368.50, in-
terest, fees, and the costs of sale, I
will expose for sale to the highest
and best bidder at the Courthouse
door, in Mt. Sterling, Montgomery
County, Kentucky, on Saturday,
April 26, 2025, at the hour of 12:00
p.m., the following described prop-
erty:
Property Address: 529 Oakmont
Drive, Mt. Sterling, KY 40353
P V A  M a p  N u m b e r :
022-60-01-065.00
BEING THE SAME PROPERTY-
Conveyed to Brandy L. Dragoo
and Joshua A. Dragoo by that
deed dated October 30, 2008 and
recorded November 24, 2008 in
Book 285, Page 210 of the records
of the Clerk of Montgomery
County, Kentucky.
This property is sold subject to all
real estate taxes, easements, and
off-sales of record; and reference
is hereby made to the office of the
Montgomery County Clerk.The
terms of the sale shall be ten
(10%) percent cash or check at the
time of sale and the balance on
credit of thirty (30) days with privi-
lege of the successful bidder to
pay in full at the time of sale. The
successful bidder requesting credit
must execute bond with approved
surety bearing interest at the rate
of (6.5%) per annum from date of
sale until paid, which bond shall
have the full force and effect of a
Judgment and should execution be
issued thereon, no replevy shall be
allowed. A lien shall exist and shall
be retained by the Commissioner
on the property sold as security for
the purchase price. Appraisal infor-
mation and photos will be posted,
w h e n  a v a i l a b l e ,  a t
www.facebook.com/mcmastercom-
missioner.

/s/Angela A. Patrick
Hon. Angela A. Patrick,

Master Commissioner
Montgomery County

Patrick & Leighton, PLLC
Attorneys at Law

25 West Main Street
Mt. Sterling, KY 40353

(859)498-2912 (859)498-7771 fax
mcmastercommissioner

@gmail.com

COMMONWEALTH OF
KENTUCKY

MONTGOMERY CIRCUIT COURT
DIVISION I

ACTION NO. 24-CI-90236
Electronically Filed

PENNYMAC LOAN SERVICING,
LLC, PLAINTIFF
v.
HEIDI JO DOWNEY SMITH, ET
AL., DEFENDANTS

NOTICE OF COMMISSIONER’S
SALE

By virtue of a Judgment and Order
of Sale entered in MontgomeryCir-
cuit Court on March 28, 2025, to
raise the sum of $93,963.72, inter-
est, fees, and the costs of sale, I
will expose for sale to the highest
and best bidder at the Courthouse
door, in Mt. Sterling, Montgomery
County, Kentucky, on Saturday,
April 26, 2025, at the hour of 12:00
p.m., the following described prop-
erty:
Property Address: 144 Derby
Drive, Mt. Sterling, KY 40353
P V A  M a p  N u m b e r :
031-70-01-013.00
BEING THE SAME PROPERTY-
Conveyed to Heidi Jo Downey
Smith, an unmarried woman by
deed dated May 11, 2018 and re-
corded May 15, 2018 in Book 324,
Page 304 filed in the Office of the
Clerk of Montgomery County, Ky.
This property is sold subject to all
real estate taxes, easements, and
off-sales of record; and reference
is hereby made to the office of the
Montgomery County Clerk.The
terms of the sale shall be ten
(10%) percent cash or check at the
time of sale and the balance on
credit of thirty (30) days with privi-
lege of the successful bidder to
pay in full at the time of sale. The
successful bidder requesting credit
must execute bond with approved
surety bearing interest at the rate
of (5%) per annum from date of
sale until paid, which bond shall
have the full force and effect of a
Judgment and should execution be
issued thereon, no replevy shall be
allowed. A lien shall exist and shall
be retained by the Commissioner
on the property sold as security for
the purchase price. Appraisal infor-
mation and photos will be posted,
w h e n  a v a i l a b l e ,  a t
www.facebook.com/mcmastercom-
missioner.

/s/Angela A. Patrick
Hon. Angela A. Patrick,

Master Commissioner
Montgomery County

Patrick & Leighton,
PLLC Attorneys at Law

25 West Main Street
Mt. Sterling, KY 40353

(859)498-2912 (859)498-7771 fax
mcmastercommissioner

@gmail.com
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MONTGOMERY CIRCUIT COURT
DIVISION I

ACTION NO. 24-CI-90236
Electronically Filed

PENNYMAC LOAN SERVICING,
LLC, PLAINTIFF
v.
HEIDI JO DOWNEY SMITH, ET
AL., DEFENDANTS

NOTICE OF COMMISSIONER’S
SALE

By virtue of a Judgment and Order
of Sale entered in MontgomeryCir-
cuit Court on March 28, 2025, to
raise the sum of $93,963.72, inter-
est, fees, and the costs of sale, I
will expose for sale to the highest
and best bidder at the Courthouse
door, in Mt. Sterling, Montgomery
County, Kentucky, on Saturday,
April 26, 2025, at the hour of 12:00
p.m., the following described prop-
erty:
Property Address: 144 Derby
Drive, Mt. Sterling, KY 40353
P V A  M a p  N u m b e r :
031-70-01-013.00
BEING THE SAME PROPERTY-
Conveyed to Heidi Jo Downey
Smith, an unmarried woman by
deed dated May 11, 2018 and re-
corded May 15, 2018 in Book 324,
Page 304 filed in the Office of the
Clerk of Montgomery County, Ky.
This property is sold subject to all
real estate taxes, easements, and
off-sales of record; and reference
is hereby made to the office of the
Montgomery County Clerk.The
terms of the sale shall be ten
(10%) percent cash or check at the
time of sale and the balance on
credit of thirty (30) days with privi-
lege of the successful bidder to
pay in full at the time of sale. The
successful bidder requesting credit
must execute bond with approved
surety bearing interest at the rate
of (5%) per annum from date of
sale until paid, which bond shall
have the full force and effect of a
Judgment and should execution be
issued thereon, no replevy shall be
allowed. A lien shall exist and shall
be retained by the Commissioner
on the property sold as security for
the purchase price. Appraisal infor-
mation and photos will be posted,
w h e n  a v a i l a b l e ,  a t
www.facebook.com/mcmastercom-
missioner.

/s/Angela A. Patrick
Hon. Angela A. Patrick,

Master Commissioner
Montgomery County

Patrick & Leighton,
PLLC Attorneys at Law

25 West Main Street
Mt. Sterling, KY 40353

(859)498-2912 (859)498-7771 fax
mcmastercommissioner

@gmail.com

COMMONWEALTH
OF KENTUCKY

MONTGOMERY CIRCUIT COURT
DIVISION I

ACTION NO. 24-CI-90015
Electronically Filed

HIPPOLYTE, LLC, PLAINTIFF
v.
TIM SNEDEGAR, ET AL., DEFEN-
DANTS

NOTICE OF COMMISSIONER’S
SALE

By virtue of a Judgment and Order
of Sale entered in MontgomeryCir-
cuit Court on March 18, 2025, to
raise the sum of $7,314.04, inter-
est, fees, and the costs of sale, I
will expose for sale to the highest
and best bidder at the Courthouse
door, in Mt. Sterling, Montgomery
County, Kentucky, on Saturday,
April 26, 2025, at the hour of 12:00
p.m., the following described prop-
erty:
Property Address: 109 Larkspur
Drive, Mt. Sterling, KY 40353 PVA
Map Number: 23M-40-11-037.00
BEING THE SAME PROPERTY-
Conveyed to Tim Snedegar by
deed dated July 8, 2009 and re-
corded in Dee Book 287, Page 493
of the Montgomery County Court
Clerk’s Office.
This property is sold subject to all
real estate taxes, easements, and
off-sales of record; and reference
is hereby made to the office of the
Montgomery County Clerk.The
terms of the sale shall be ten
(10%) percent cash or check at the
time of sale and the balance on
credit of thirty (30) days with privi-
lege of the successful bidder to
pay in full at the time of sale. The
successful bidder requesting credit
must execute bond with approved
surety bearing interest at the rate
of (6%) per annum from date of
sale until paid, which bond shall
have the full force and effect of a
Judgment and should execution be
issued thereon, no replevy shall be
allowed. A lien shall exist and shall
be retained by the Commissioner
on the property sold as security for
the purchase price. Appraisal infor-
mation and photos will be posted,
w h e n  a v a i l a b l e ,  a t
www.facebook.com/mcmastercom-
missioner.

/s/Angela A. Patrick
Hon. Angela A. Patrick,

Master Commissioner
Montgomery County

Patrick & Leighton, PLLC
Attorneys at Law

25 West Main Street
Mt. Sterling, KY 40353

(859)498-2912 (859)498-7771 fax
mcmastercommissioner

@gmail.com
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COMMONWEALTH
OF KENTUCKY

MONTGOMERY CIRCUIT COURT
DIVISION I

ACTION NO. 24-CI-90015
Electronically Filed

HIPPOLYTE, LLC, PLAINTIFF
v.
TIM SNEDEGAR, ET AL., DEFEN-
DANTS

NOTICE OF COMMISSIONER’S
SALE

By virtue of a Judgment and Order
of Sale entered in MontgomeryCir-
cuit Court on March 18, 2025, to
raise the sum of $7,314.04, inter-
est, fees, and the costs of sale, I
will expose for sale to the highest
and best bidder at the Courthouse
door, in Mt. Sterling, Montgomery
County, Kentucky, on Saturday,
April 26, 2025, at the hour of 12:00
p.m., the following described prop-
erty:
Property Address: 109 Larkspur
Drive, Mt. Sterling, KY 40353 PVA
Map Number: 23M-40-11-037.00
BEING THE SAME PROPERTY-
Conveyed to Tim Snedegar by
deed dated July 8, 2009 and re-
corded in Dee Book 287, Page 493
of the Montgomery County Court
Clerk’s Office.
This property is sold subject to all
real estate taxes, easements, and
off-sales of record; and reference
is hereby made to the office of the
Montgomery County Clerk.The
terms of the sale shall be ten
(10%) percent cash or check at the
time of sale and the balance on
credit of thirty (30) days with privi-
lege of the successful bidder to
pay in full at the time of sale. The
successful bidder requesting credit
must execute bond with approved
surety bearing interest at the rate
of (6%) per annum from date of
sale until paid, which bond shall
have the full force and effect of a
Judgment and should execution be
issued thereon, no replevy shall be
allowed. A lien shall exist and shall
be retained by the Commissioner
on the property sold as security for
the purchase price. Appraisal infor-
mation and photos will be posted,
w h e n  a v a i l a b l e ,  a t
www.facebook.com/mcmastercom-
missioner.

/s/Angela A. Patrick
Hon. Angela A. Patrick,

Master Commissioner
Montgomery County

Patrick & Leighton, PLLC
Attorneys at Law

25 West Main Street
Mt. Sterling, KY 40353

(859)498-2912 (859)498-7771 fax
mcmastercommissioner

@gmail.com

COMMONWEALTH
OF KENTUCKY

MONTGOMERY CIRCUIT COURT
DIVISION I

ACTION NO. 24-CI-90185
Electronically Filed

FREEDOM MORTGAGE CORPO-
RATION, PLAINTIFF
v.
SARA HOLLAND, AS ADMINIS-
TRATRIX OF THE ESTATE OF
LINDA L. MARTIN, ET AL., DE-
FENDANTS

NOTICE OF COMMISSIONER’S
SALE

By virtue of a Judgment and Order
of Sale entered in MontgomeryCir-
cuit Court on March 28, 2025, to
raise the sum of $178,237.32, in-
terest, fees, and the costs of sale, I
will expose for sale to the highest
and best bidder at the Courthouse
door, in Mt. Sterling, Montgomery
County, Kentucky, on Saturday,
April 26, 2025, at the hour of 12:00
p.m., the following described prop-
erty:
Property Address: 3021 Old Ow-
ingsville Road
P V A  M a p  N u m b e r :
031-40-07-006.00
BEING THE SAME PROPERTY-
Conveyed from Rex Martin and
Janet Martin, his wife, to James D.
Martin and Linda L. Martin, his
wife, for and during their joint lives,
with remainder in fee simple to the
survivor of them as set forth in
Deed Book 181, Page 157 dated
04/02/1986, recorded 04/03/1986,
Montgomery County, Kentucky.
Being the same property conveyed
to Sara Holland, 1?2 and James
Todd Martin 1?2, by virtue of Affi-
davit of Descent for Linda Martin,
died widowed and intestate on
April 6, 2023 (Montgomery Coun-
tyProbate Care 23-P-00089),
dated 01/23/2024 and recorded
02/22/2024 at Book 349, Page 34,
Montgomery County Records.
This property is sold subject to all
real estate taxes, easements, and
off-sales of record; and reference
is hereby made to the office of the
Montgomery County Clerk.
The terms of the sale shall be ten
(10%) percent cash or check at the
time of sale and the balance on
credit of thirty (30) days with privi-
lege of the successful bidder to
pay in full at the time of sale. The
successful bidder requesting credit
must execute bond with approved
surety bearing interest at the rate
of (3.75%) per annum from date of
sale until paid, which bond shall
have the full force and effect of a
Judgment and should execution be
issued thereon, no replevy shall be
allowed. A lien shall exist and shall
be retained by the Commissioner
on the property sold as security for
the purchase price. Appraisal infor-
mation and photos will be posted,
w h e n  a v a i l a b l e ,  a t
www.facebook.com/mcmastercom-
missioner.

/s/Angela A. Patrick
Hon. Angela A. Patrick,

Master Commissioner
Montgomery County

Patrick & Leighton, PLLC
Attorneys at Law

25 West Main Street
Mt. Sterling, KY 40353

(859)498-2912 (859)498-7771 fax
mcmastercommissioner

@gmail.com


