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CLASSIFIEDS 
WORK! 

MAKE THEM 
WORK FOR 

YOU!

Use QR Code to 
Search Kentucky 

Public Notices 
or go to 

kypublicnotice.
com

PUPPIES, 
DOGS, 
KITTENS, AND 
CATS:  Glasgow/
Barren County 
Animal Center.  
175 Trojan Trail, 
or call 270-651-
PAWS (7297)

PETS

LOGGING 
SERVICES

STANDING 
TIMBER: Nolin 
River Logging, 
Certified Ken-
tucky Master 
Logger. In busi-
ness since 1983. 
270-528-1537.

WOOD 
FURNACES BUSINESS & SERVICES

DIRECTORY
APARTMENTS LOGGING

ROOFING

STATEWIDE CLASSIFIEDS

Classifieds 
Work! Make 

Them Work For 
You!

BUYING 
4-Wheelers, 
Tractors, Zero-
Turns, Golf Carts, 
Trailers, Side by 
Sides, etc. Call 
or Text 270-766-
9940.

Absolutely 
NO hunting, 
trespassing, or 
growing of crops 
on the farm or 
farms of Betty 
Jo Faulkner. 
All rights have 
been leased and 
legally recorded 
for 2025 - 2026. 
All land is under 
surveillance and 
you WILL BE 
prosecuted. NO 
exception.

BATHROOM REMODEL
BEAUTIFUL BATH UPDATES 
in as little as ONE DAY! Superior 
quality bath and shower systems at 
AFFORDABLE PRICES!  Lifetime 
warranty & professional installs.  Call 
Now! 1-833-770-0957

Jacuzzi Bath Remodel can install a 
new, custom bath or shower in as little 
as one day. For a limited time, waiving 
ALL installation costs! (Additional 
terms apply. Subject to change and 
vary by dealer. (Offer ends 6/30/25.) 
Call 1-866-837-5986

Safe Step. North America’s #1 Walk-
In Tub. Comprehensive lifetime 
warranty. Top-of-the-line installation 
and service. Now featuring our FREE 
shower package and $1600 Off for a 
limited time! Call today! Financing 
available. Call Safe Step 1-888-302-
4539

BUSINESS SPACE FOR RENT
Frankfort Office Space for rent: 
Second floor with four large office 
areas, restroom. Office desks 
furnished. Located ½ mile from I-64 
Lawrenceburg exit 53A. Electric, 
water, gas, utilities and internet 
included. $2,200  per month.  Call 
Bonnie Howard, Kentucky Press 
Association, 502-223-8821.

BUYING HOUSES
We Buy Houses for Cash AS IS! No 
repairs. No fuss. Any condition. Easy 
three step process: Call, get cash offer 
and get paid. Get your fair cash offer 
today by calling Liz Buys Houses: 
1-888-287-5615

CABLE/UTILITIES
DIRECTV OVER INTERNET - Get 
your favorite live TV, sports and 
local channels. 99% signal reliability! 
CHOICE Package, $84.99/mo for 
12 months. HBO Max and Premium 
Channels included for 3 mos (w/
CHOICE Package or higher.) No 
annual contract, no hidden fees! Some 
restrictions apply. Call IVS 1-888-340-
6138

AFFORDABLE TV & INTERNET. If 
you are overpaying for your service, 
call now for a free quote and see how 
much you can save! 1-877-548-7494

Get DISH Satellite TV + Internet!  
Free Install, Free HD-DVR Upgrade, 
80,000 On-Demand Movies, Plus 
Limited Time Up To $600 In Gift 
Cards. Call Today! 1-855-633-4574

DIRECTV- All your entertainment. 
Nothing on your roof! Sign up for 
Directv and get your first three 
months of Max, Paramount+, 
Showtime, Starz, MGM+ and Cinemax 
included. Choice package $84.99/
mo. Some restrictions apply. Call 
DIRECTV 1-866-292-5435

CELLULAR      
Consumer Cellular - the same reliable, 
nationwide coverage as the largest 
carriers. No long-term contract, no 
hidden fees and activation is free. All 
plans feature unlimited talk and text, 
starting at just $20/month. For more 
information, call 1-833-353-2982

DEBT HELP
Inflation is at 40 year highs. Interest 
rates are way up. Credit Cards. 
Medical Bills. Car Loans. Do you 
have $10k or more in debt? Call 
NATIONAL DEBT RELIEF and find 
out how to pay off your debt for 
significantly less than what you owe! 
FREE quote: Call 1-844-262-5602

FOOD SERVICES
Omaha Steaks Wines. 12 world class 
wines (and bonus gifts) for ONLY 
$79.99 (plus s/h.) Save $160! 12 new 
wine selections plus a FREE $25 
Omaha Steaks E-reward card every 
three months. Cancel anytime. 100% 
guarantee! Call 1-844-740-5945 and 
mention code AGJF002 or visit www.
GetOSWine.com/sip169

HEALTH
Stroke and Cardiovascular disease 
are leading causes of death, according 
to the American Heart Association. 
Screenings can provide peace of mind 
or early detection! Contact Life Line 
Screening to schedule your screening. 
Special offer - 5 screenings for just 
$149. Call 1-877-465-1309 CROSSWORD ANSWERS CAN BE FOUND ON PAGE SEVEN

LEGAL NOTICE
FIDUCIARIES HAVE BEEN 
APPOINTED in the Metcalfe District 
Court in the following Estates during 
the month of APRIL, 2025. All claims 
of creditors must be made against 
these Estates no later than six (6) 
months from the date of appointment 
by filing a claim with the personal 
representative or the probate clerk of 
the Metcalfe District court pursuant to 
KRS Chapter 396.
Case# 25-P-00031, Estate of Joseph 
Slinker, Sr., (DOD: 3/25/2023), 
2676 Sulphur Well-Knob Lick Road, 
Center, KY 42214, Joseph E. Slinker, 
Jr. – Executor, 10068 Holy Road, 
Mecanicsville, VA 23116, Hon. Sharon 
Bowles Howard, Attorney, P.O. Box 
999, Edmonton, KY 42129, Date of 
Appointment: 4/16/2025
Case# 25-P-00038, Estate Elva Lee 
Gibson, 254 Echo Road, Knob Lick, 
KY 42154, Julie Nunn – Executrix, 
1192 Trillium Lane, Bowling Green, 
KY 42104, Hon. Holly Coleman, 
Attorney, P.O. Box 300, Edmonton, 
KY 42129, Date of Appointment: 
4/23/2025
Case# 25-P-00039, Estate of Cecil 
Dewayne McCoy, 1674 Nobob-
Summer Shade Road, Summer Shade, 
KY 42166, Shelvy Jean McCoy – 
Executrix, 1674 Nobob-Summer Shade 
Road, Summer Shade, KY 42166, Hon. 
Herbert Sparks, Attorney, P.O. Box 
509, Edmonton, KY 42129, Date of 
Appointment: 4/30/2025

NOTICE BUYING

LEGAL NOTICE


