
LEGAL NOTICE 

Notice is hereby 
given that the 26 
day of March, 2025, 
Garyon Norris of 298 
AH Boston Road, 
Edmonton, KY, 42129, 
by the consideration 
of the District Court of 
Cumberland County, 
was qualified and ap-
pointed as Executor of 
the estate of Patty Bow, 
deceased, of Burkesville, 
Kentucky. Any persons 
having claims of any 
kind against said estate 
should present the same 
to the court and the 
undersigned, properly 
verified as required by 
law, within six (6) 
months from the date 
of said appointment. 
Likewise, any person 
indebted to the estate 
should make payment to 
the undersigned.

Garyon Norris,  
Executor 

Hon. Coleman Hurt 
PO Box 414 

Burkesville, KY 
42717 

chg 4/2, 4/9

LEGAL NOTICE 

Notice is hereby given 
that the 24 day of 
March, 2025, Pamela 
Kay Flowers of 121 Ill 
Will Road, Burkesville, 
KY, 42717, by consid-
eration of the District 
Court of Cumberland 
County, was quali-
fied and appointed as 
Administratrix of the 
estate of Shelley Kay 
Flowers Daniels, de-
ceased, of Burkesville, 
Kentucky. Any persons 
having claims of any 
kind against said estate 
should present the same 
to the court and the 
undersigned, properly 
verified as required by 
law, within six (6) 
months from the date 
of said appointment. 
Likewise, any person 
indebted to the estate 
should make payment to 
the undersigned.

Pamela Kay Flowers,  
Administratrix 

Hon. Holly Parrigin 
124 N. Main St. 

Burkesville, KY 
42717 

chg 4/2, 4/9

LEGAL NOTICE 

Notice is hereby given 
that the 19 day of 
March, 2025, Rondall 
Wray of P.O. Box 
576, Burkesville, KY, 
42717, by the consid-
eration of the District 
Court of Cumberland 
County, was quali-
fied and appointed as 
Administrator of the es-
tate of Roy Raven Craft, 
deceased, of Burkesville, 
Kentucky. Any persons 
having claims of any 
kind against said estate 
should present the same 
to the court and the 
undersigned, properly 
verified as required by 
law, within six (6) 
months from the date 
of said appointment. 
Likewise, any person 

indebted to the estate 
should make payment to 
the undersigned.

Rondall Wray,  
Administrator 

Hon. David Cross 
200 E. Cumberland 

St. 
Albany, KY 42602 

chg 3/26, 4/2

BUSINESS SPACE 
FOR RENT

Frankfort Office Space 
for rent: Second floor 
with four large of-
fice areas, restroom. 
Office desks furnished. 
Located ½ mile from 
I-64 Lawrenceburg exit 
53A. Electric, water, 
gas, utilities and inter-
net included. $2,200 
per month.  Call Bonnie 
Howard, Kentucky 
Press Association, 
502-223-8821.

BUYING CARS

We buy 8,000 cars a 
week. Sell your old, 
busted or junk car with 
no hoops, haggles or 
headaches. Sell your car 
to Peddle. Easy three 
step process. Instant 
offer. Free pickup. 
Fast payment. Call 
1-844-440-0399

BUYING HOUSES

We Buy Houses for Cash 
AS IS! No repairs. No 
fuss. Any condition. 
Easy three step process: 
Call, get cash offer and 
get paid. Get your fair 
cash offer today by call-
ing Liz Buys Houses: 
1-888-287-5615

CABLE/UTILITIES

DIRECTV OVER 
INTERNET - Get your 
favorite live TV, sports 
and local channels. 
99% signal reliabil-
ity! CHOICE Package, 
$84.99/mo for 12 
months. HBO Max and 
Premium Channels 
included for 3 mos (w/
CHOICE Package or 
higher.) No annual 
contract, no hidden fees! 
Some restrictions apply. 
Call IVS 1-888-340-6138

AFFORDABLE TV & 
INTERNET. If you are 
overpaying for your 
service, call now for a 
free quote and see how 
much you can save! 
1-877-548-7494

Get DISH Satellite TV + 
Internet!  Free Install, 
Free HD-DVR Upgrade, 
80,000 On-Demand 
Movies, Plus Limited 
Time Up To $600 In 
Gift Cards. Call Today! 
1-855-633-4574

DIRECTV- All your 
entertainment. Nothing 
on your roof! Sign up 
for Directv and get 
your first three months 

of Max, Paramount+, 
Showtime, Starz, MGM+ 
and Cinemax included. 
Choice package $84.99/
mo. Some restrictions 
apply. Call DIRECTV 
1-866-292-5435

CELLULAR       

Get Boost Infinite! 
Unlimited Talk, Text 
and Data For Just $25/
mo! The Power Of 3 
5G Networks, One Low 
Price! Call Today and 
Get The Latest iPhone 
Every Year On Us! 
855-841-2894

Consumer Cellular - the 
same reliable, nation-
wide coverage as the 
largest carriers. No 
long-term contract, no 
hidden fees and activa-
tion is free. All plans 
feature unlimited talk 
and text, starting at 
just $20/month. For 
more information, call 
1-833-353-2982

DONATIONS 
(VEHICLES)

Donate your car, truck, 
boat, RV and more to 
support our veterans! 
Schedule a FAST, FREE 
vehicle pickup and 
receive a top tax deduc-
tion! Call Veteran Car 
Donations at 1-833-984-
2146 today!

GOT AN UNWANTED 
CAR??? DONATE IT TO 
PATRIOTIC HEARTS. 
Fast free pick up. All 50 
States. Patriotic Hearts’ 
programs help veterans 
find work or start their 
own business. Call 24/7: 
1-833-485-3141. 

Get a break on your 
taxes! Donate your car, 
truck, or SUV to assist 
the blind and visu-
ally impaired. Arrange 
a swift, no-cost vehicle 
pickup and secure a 
generous tax credit for 
2025. Call Heritage for 
the Blind Today at 1-877-
581-3053 today!

FOOD SERVICES

When you want the best, 
you want Omaha Steaks! 
100% guaranteed and 
delivered to your door! 
Our Butcher’s Deluxe 
Package makes a great 
gift and comes with 8 
FREE Burgers ONLY 
$99.99.  Call 1-877-
395-9131 and mention 
code 77318CZL  or visit 
www.omahasteaks.com/
Deluxe9671

Omaha Steaks Wines. 12 
world class wines (and 
bonus gifts) for ONLY 
$79.99 (plus s/h.) Save 
$160! 12 new wine selec-
tions plus a FREE $25 
Omaha Steaks E-reward 
card every three months. 
Cancel anytime. 100% 
guarantee! Call 1-844-
740-5945 and mention 
code AGJF002 or visit 
www.GetOSWine.com/
sip169

HEALTH

Portable Oxygen 

Concentrator May Be 
Covered by Medicare! 
Reclaim independence 
and mobility with the 
compact design and long-
lasting battery of Inogen 
One. Free information 
kit! Call 888-982-0374

Stroke and 
Cardiovascular disease 
are leading causes of 
death, according to 
the American Heart 
Association. Screenings 
can provide peace of 
mind or early detec-
tion! Contact Life Line 
Screening to schedule 
your screening. Special 
offer - 5 screenings 
for just $149. Call 
1-877-465-1309

HOME 
IMPROVEMENT

SunSetter. America’s 
Number One Awning! 
Instant shade at the 
touch of a button. 
Transform your deck or 
patio into an outdoor 
oasis. Up to 10-year lim-
ited warranty. Call now 
and SAVE $350 today! 
1-866-348-8793

NEED NEW 
WINDOWS?  Drafty 
rooms? Chipped or 
damaged frames? Need 
outside noise reduction? 
New, energy efficient 
windows may be the 
answer! Call for a con-
sultation & FREE quote 
today. 1-833-890-2083.  
You will be asked for the 
zip code of the property 
when connecting.

Replace your roof with 
the best looking and 
longest lasting material 
– steel from Erie Metal 
Roofs! Three styles and 
multiple colors avail-
able. Guaranteed to last 
a lifetime! Limited Time 
Offer – up to 50% off 
installation + Additional 
10% off install (for 
military, health work-
ers & 1st responders.) 
Call Erie Metal Roofs: 
1-888-306-0302

WARNING: Your home 
may need new Siding, 
Windows or Roofs. SAVE 
MONEY before the hur-
ricane drives prices back 
up and it’s to late.  Huge 
Discounts & Financing 
available. 800-350-0591 
to learn more.

Eliminate gutter clean-
ing forever! LeafFilter, 
the most advanced 
debris-blocking gutter 
protection. Schedule 
a FREE LeafFilter 
estimate today. 20% 
off Entire Purchase. 
Plus 10% Senior & 
Military Discounts. Call 
1-866-329-2415

Call LeafGuard and say 
goodbye to gutter clean-
ing for good. No clean-
ing. No leaking. No water 
damage. No more ladder 
accidents. Get LeafGuard 
today and be protected 
for life. FREE estimate. 
Financing available. 

20% off total purchase 
(Restrictions may apply.) 
Call 1-866-850-6999

Safe Step. North 
America’s #1 Walk-In 
Tub. Comprehensive 
lifetime warranty. Top-
of-the-line installation 
and service. Now featur-
ing our FREE shower 
package and $1600 Off 
for a limited time! Call 
today! Financing avail-
able. Call Safe Step 
1-888-302-4539

Jacuzzi Bath Remodel 
can install a new, custom 
bath or shower in as 
little as one day. For a 
limited time, waiving 
ALL installation costs! 
(Additional terms apply. 
Subject to change and 
vary by dealer. (Offer 
ends 6/30/25.) Call 
1-866-837-5986

HOME SERVICES

Prepare for pow-
er outages with 
Briggs & Stratton® 
PowerProtect(TM) 
standby generators - the 
most powerful home 
standby generators avail-
able. Industry-leading 
comprehensive war-
ranty - 7 years ($849 
value.) Proudly made in 
the U.S.A. Call Briggs & 
Stratton 1-877-548-2927.

Prepare for power 
outages today with a 
Generac Home Standby 
Generator. Act now to 
receive a FREE 5-Year 
warranty with quali-
fying purchase. Call 
1-844-688-8576 today to 
schedule a free quote. It’s 
not just a generator. It’s a 
power move.

INSURANCE 
SERVICES

Up to $15,000.00 of 
GUARANTEED Life 
Insurance! No medical 
exam or health ques-
tions. Cash to help pay 
funeral and other final 
expenses. Call Physicians 
Life Insurance Company- 
844-950-2448 or visit 
www.Life55plus.info/
kypress

MUSICAL 
INSTRUMENTS

TOP CASH PAID FOR 
OLD GUITARS! 1920-
1980 Gibson, Martin, 
Fender, Gretsch, 
Epiphone, Guild, 
Mosrite, Rickenbacker, 
Prairie State, D’Angelico, 
Stromberg. And Gibson 
Madolins/Banjos. 
1-833-641-7011

LESLIE CEMETERY 

Anyone wishing to 
make a donation for the 
2025  mowing/mainte-
nance fees please send 

check/funds to: Leslie 
Cemetery Fund, C/O 
Patricia Thomas, P.O. 
Box 37, Burkesville, Ky.,  
42717 or C/O First & 
Farmer’s Nat’l Bank, P.O. 
Box 337, Burkesville, Ky. 
42717. Your donations 
are greatly appreciated.
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BURKESVILLE MANOR APTS
ACCEPTING APPLICATIONS    Aceptar Solicitudes

Age 62 & Older    Edad 62 y mayores
FOR 1-BDR & EFFICIENCY APARTMENTS

Burkesville Manor Apartments
225 Lower River Street • Burkesville, KY • 270-864-4171

Rent based on income     Alquiler basado en ingresos
Apply in person or call:     Solicite en persona o llame

TTY 1-800-648-6056 (for hearing impaired only)
Managed by: Lake Cumberland Housing Agency, Inc

www.lakecumberlandhousing.com

Alpine Lodge
P.O. Box 7070
Burkesville, KY 42717
Phone: 270-864-7100
www.alpinemotel.com

Camping with 
the Cows
Near Dale Hollow Lake
Burkesville, KY 42717
Phone: 270-407-0231
sarah@southerndot.com

Copper Hollow 
Bed & Breakfast
3462 State Park Road
Burkesville, KY 42717
Phone: 270-433-7100

Dale Hollow Lake
State Resort Park
5970 State Park Rd.
Reservations: 1-800-325-
2282
Lodge: 270-433-7431
https://parks.ky.gov/fi nd-
parks/resortparks/dh/

Dale Hollow 
Builders
2610/2622 State Park Rd
Burkesville, KY 42717

Dale Hollow 
Happy Hill Chalet
Burkesville, KY 42717
Phone: 502-321-7173
hhchalet@gmail.com
www.happyhillchalet.com

Fisherman’s Cove
145 Gar Whicker Rd.
Burkesville, KY 42717
Phone: 270-433-5898
www.tracesonthecumber-
land.com

Hendricks Creek 
Resort
945 Hendricks Creek Rd.
Burkesville, KY 42717
Phone: 1-888-321-4000 or 
270-433-7172
www.hendrickscreekre-
sort.com

Hidden Cave Ranch 
Bed and Breakfast
877 Thrasher Road
Burkesville, KY 42717
Phone: 270-433-3225
Email: info@hiddencaver-
anch.com
Website: www.hiddencav-
eranch.com

Lake Star Acres
305 Christian Chapel 
Road
Burkesville, KY 42717
Phone: 502-439-5103
Email: lakestaracres@
gmail.com

River Breeze 
Retreat
500 River Breeze Road
Burkesville, KY 42717
Phone: 270-406-3536
Email: riverbreezer-
etreat@gmail.com

Riverfront Lodge
P.O. Box 417
Burkesville, KY 42717
Phone: 270-864-3300
www.riverfrontlodge.net

Sulphur Creek 
Resort, Inc
3622 Sulphur Creek Road
Burkesville, KY 42717
Phone: 270-433-7272
Email: scr@duo-County.com
www.sulphurcreek.com

The Cottage
304 Valley Drive
Burkesville, KY 42717
Phone; 270-406-2888
Email: smith2012@
duo-county.com

The Concetta De
Bed and Breakfast
75 Waterview Cut Off
Burkesville, KY 42717
Phone: 270-883-0099
Email: theconcettade@
gmail.com


