
Harper presiding and 
all magistrates present. 
Minutes of March 25, 
2025 were approved 
with no corrections or 
amendments.

The bills list was 
presented and 
approved with a 
transfer of funds from 
the general account in 
the amount of $23,000 
to the Jail Fund and 
$8,500 to the Transfer 
Station Fund. Items for 
the proposed 2025-
2026 budget need to 
be submitted by the 
April 22, 2025 meeting 
with a public hearing 
for Local Government 
Economic Assistance 
and County Road 
Aid prior. A budget 
workshop will be held 
May 1, 2025 at 5:30 
p.m. to finalize the 
budget.
Judge-Executive 
Harper recognized 

Kentucky 
Transportation Cabinet 
Rural Secondary 
Road representatives 
Joe Plunk and 
Cody Conner. 
Plunk reviewed the 
magistrates with 
funding amounting to 
$1.5 million including 
carry over from last 
budget year.  Ky. 1855 
Walnut Creek Road to 
Hwy. 31-E will receive 
a one inch of asphalt 
topping. 

Flex Funds account 
will be $223,269. 
Projects to be 
completed by June 
30, 2025 include 
Hwy. 1533 from Hwy. 
101 to Hwy. 252 and 
Hwy. 240 from the 
Warren County Line 
to 31-E. Perrytown 
Road (state road 
part) will be repaved 
with a better quality 
of paving for longer 

lasting pavement 
and be completed by 
November 30, 2025. 
Ongoing development 
for reconstruction 
of the curve west of 
Barren River Bridge on 
Hwy. 98 is slated to be 
completed in 2025.

A resolution of the 
first reading was held 
for closing Dog Trot 
Road with a public 
hearing May 15, 2025. 
The action stems from 
county maintenance 
of roadway from July 
2013. 

Sheriff Brandon 
Ford reported the 
department received 
942 calls for service in 
March including five 
alcohol, 23 accidents, 
14 alarm calls, 12 
domestic violence, 
seven motorist assists, 
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I don’t know how many 
times we’ve watched 
it, but when “The Ten 
Commandments” 
come on, we watch it 
again. Usually it’s on 
the Saturday night 
before Easter, but it 
came on last Saturday 
night. I know they 
added some effects to 
it that probably didn’t 
happen, but it follows 
along pretty well with 
the Bible.

Don’t forget: Der 
Dutch Bakery, 296 
Perrytown Road, is 
scheduled to open on 
April 19.

Whispering Pines on 
Old Franklin Road will 
open for the season on 
April 25.

Congratulations to 
Liberty Falica on being 
one of 56 Kentucky 
high school students 
out of 1,350 applicants 
accepted into the 
Visual Arts portion 
of this summer’s 
Governor’s School of 
Arts. My mother-in-
law, Frankie Lambert, 
enjoyed giving Liberty 
art lessons when she 
was a little girl. I know 
Frankie would be really 
proud of Liberty.

The Trammel Creek 
Homemakers are 
still taking orders for 
hanging baskets of 
wave petunias, vinca, 
Boston ferns and 
baskets and bowls of 
succulents. Cash or 
checks are accepted 
as payment. Contact 
any homemaker to 
place your order 
before April 20. All 
florals are $20 each 
and will be delivered 
before Mother’s Day. 
Proceeds go toward 
supporting our 
community.

Scottsville Loves has 
a project called The 
Hands and Feet of 
Jesus Food Mission. 
They are selling tickets 
on a Blackstone Grill, 
one dollar each or six 
for five dollars. The 
grill will be given away 
on First Friday on 
the Square on May 2. 
You don’t have to be 
present to win. The 
grill is currently on 
display at The Heart of 
Scottsville and you can 
buy tickets there. All 
the funds raised will 

go toward the mission 
of Scottsville Loves 
to feed people when 
devastation hits.

Barbara McClard and 
Rita Hale Wilburn 
went on a bus trip 
recently with the 
Macon County Retired 
Teachers to see 
“Singin’ In the Rain” in 
Clarksville, Ind.

Hours have been 
set for the FFA 
Greenhouse: Monday 
noon-4 p.m., Tuesday 
and Wednesday 8-9 
a.m., Thursday 8-9 
a.m. and noon-4 p.m., 
Friday noon-3 p.m. 
and Saturday, April 19 
and April 26, 9 a.m. - 
12:30 p.m. They close 
for inclement weather.

Our granddaughter, 
Hannah, and her 
SKEVA 16 Blue team 
were in Franklin, 
Tenn., over the 
weekend for the AAU 
Mid-South Challenge. 
We went on Saturday 
to watch the pool 
play and they won all 
three of their games. 
We didn’t get to go 
back on Sunday, but 
thankfully one of the 
fathers streamed it 
on Facebook and we 
were able to watch 
most of their four 
games, including the 
championship game, 
which SKEVA won. 
Woo-hoo! Champions!

I won’t name names, 
but a certain neighbor 
of ours recently had 
some unusual driving 
hazards the other day. 
Not far from his house 
he almost ran over 
eight mules and two 
horses in the road. A 
couple of miles later a 
herd of 20+ deer were 
crossing the road in 
front of him. A few 
hills and curves later 
he almost ran over 
Marty Brown driving 
his lawn mower pulling 
a trailer. When he 
finally got to where he 
was going, he found 
a lady sitting on her 
couch, in the house, 
feeding raisins to a 
chicken. Oh yeah, he 
also had to wait for the 
UPS driver to move  
along because he was 
blocking the road. Do 
you think he made up 
any of that tale?

Get well wishes go to 

Mary Steele after her 
recent surgery.

Our thoughts and 
prayers are also with 
Greg and Teresa Tabor.

Sympathy is extended 
to the family of Robert 
Brady for their loss.

Romans 8:31, What 
shall we then say to 
these things? If God 
be for us, who can be 
against us?

Happy birthday to: 
Kenneth Hesson Jr., 
17th; Makayla Miller, 
17th; Deborah Stoner, 
17th; Ida Weaver, 18th; 
Ashley Spears, 19th; 
Joanna Hoover, 19th; 
Heather Sikes, 20th; 
Dorcas Miller, 20th; 
Stephen Stauffer, 20th; 
Ednarose Stoner, 20th; 
Pat Dockery, 21st; Gary 
York, 22nd; Michael 
Habegger, 22nd; 
Rachel Hoover, 22nd; 
Thomas Benjamin 
Hoover, 22nd; Leah 
Jo Brown, 23; Paul 
Hoover, 23rd.

Happy anniversary 
to: David and Nikki 
Towe, 17th; Herman 
and Gloria Lyles, 17th; 
Jotham and Grace 
Habegger, 17th; Sam 
and Linda Stoner, 
18th; Phillip and 
Rosemary Schrock, 
19th; Thomas and 
Anna Hoover, 23rd.

Our recipe of the week 
is from the kitchen 
of the late Rhoda 
Pearson:

Coconut Cream 
Cake

•1 box yellow cake mix

•1 small can cream of 
coconut

•1 can Eagle Brand 
milk

•1 (8 oz.) Cool Whip

•coconut

Bake cake according to 
directions on package 
in a 9x13 pan.

While cake is still hot, 
punch holes over top 
of cake with a fork or 
small knife. Mix cream 
of coconut and Eagle 
Brand milk and pour 
over top of cake. Let 
cool. Spread Cool Whip 
over cold cake and 
sprinkle coconut over 
top. Refrigerate.

The library will be 
closed on Friday, 
April 18 for Good 
Friday. Unless it’s a 
holiday, the library 
is open to the public 
Monday through 
Thursday from 9 a.m. 
to 7 p.m. and Friday 
and Saturday from 9 
a.m. to 4 p.m. 

Toddlers are invited 
to Toddler Time 
on Wednesdays at 
10 a.m. Parents/
guardians may choose 
from two Pre-K 
Story Hours for their 
preschool-age child. 
We’ll offer the same 
program on Tuesday 
and  Thursday at 10 
a.m. 

On Tuesday at 1 
p.m., Home-School 
children ages 5-12 are 
invited to enrichment 
programs. 

The Inbetweens, 
students ages 10-12, 
meet on Mondays 
at 3:30 p.m. Call 
(270) 237-3861 to 
reserve your child’s 
place, or click on the 
events tab at www.
allencountylibrary.
com. 

We hope you’ll make 
visiting the library a 
part of your weekly 
routine.

Tinker Time in our 
Maker Space is open 
every Friday at 2 
pm. Register online 
for help with your 
projects, or stop by 
to explore the space 
and ask questions. 
Equipment includes 
a Poster Printer, an 
Embroidery Machine, 
a Cricut Vinyl Cutter, 
Ellison Die Cut 
Shapes, and more. 
Sign up today.

New books for 
children include: 
How Do I Wonder? 
by Gianna Davy, 
Saint Valentine the 
Kindhearted Retold 
& Illustrated by Ned 
Bustard, Mermaids 
Are the Worst! by 
Alex Willan, Sunny 
Wants to Play 
by Katty Maurey, 
Wash Day Love by 
Tanisia Moore and 
Raissa Figueroa, 
Goosebumps House 
of Shivers: Say 
My Name! Say My 
Name! by R.L. Stine, I 
Survived The Sinking 
of the Titanic, 1912 
by Lauren Tarshis, I 
Survived The Great 
Molasses Flood, 1919 
by Lauren Tarshis, 
Blast From The Past 
by Geronimo Stilton, 
Speechless by Aron 
Nels Steinke, Spy 
Ski School by Stuart 

Gibbs, Tear This 
down by Barbara 
Dee, Diary of a 9-Bit 
Warrior: Journey 
to the Far Lands by 
Cube Kid, The Baby-
Sitters Club: Mallory 
and the Trouble with 
Twins by Ann. M. 
Martin, Middle School 
and Other Disasters 
by Wanda Coven, 
Easter by Nancy 
Dickmann, and Resist 
by Alan Gratz.

New books on the 
adult fiction shelf 
include: The Red 
Car to Hollywood 
by Jennie Liu, 
Hexed by Emily 
Mcintire, Nothing 
Ever Happens Here 
by Seraphina Nova 
Glass, I Am Sin by 
Helen Hardt, We 
All Live Here by Jo 
Jo Moyes, Secrets 
Between the Shelves 
by Cynthia Hickey, 
Linda Baten Johnson, 
et al, The Viper by 
J. R. Ward, The 
Secrets of Flowers 
by Sally Page, The 
Medici Return by 
Steve Berry, Bad 
Seed by Sharon Sala, 
Sabotage at Cedar 
Creek by Janice 
Thompson, The 
Unexpected Catch by 
Abbey Downey, and 
Tides of Healing by 
Sandra Merville Hart. 

New books on the 
adult non-fiction 
shelf include: 
The Fix: How the 
Twelve Steps Offer 
a Surprising Path of 
Transformation for 
the Well-Adjusted, the 
Down-and-Out, and 
Everyone In Between 
by Ian Morgan Cron, 
Solo Training: The 
Martial Artist’s Home 
Training Guide by 
Loren W. Christensen, 
Antisemitism in 
America: A Warning 
by Senator Chuck 
Schumer, and Tae 
Kwon Do, 3rd Ed. by 
Yeon Hee Park, Yeon 
Hwan Park and Jon 
Gerrard. 

Getting a free library 
card is easy. Call 
(270) 237-3861 or 
visit us with a photo 
I.D. and recently 
postmarked mail. 
Once you have your 
card, a world of 
books, movies and 
music will be at 
your fingertips. And 
remember, your voice 
matters. Let us know 
if there’s a particular 
book, movie or 
music artist you’d 
like to see in our 
collection. We’re here 
to make your library 
experience the best it 
can be.

LETTERS 
TO THE 
EDITOR: 
The Citizen-
Times welcomes 
letters to the 
editor regarding 
our publications 
or local issues 
of  importance.  
Letters should be 
no more than 300 
words; we reserve 
the right to edit for 
clarity or length, or 
to reject letters that 
are in poor taste or 
libelous.  Writers 
must include their 
name and a valid 
telephone number 
for verification 
purposes.  
Anonymous letters 
will be rejected.  
Send your letter 
by email to jobe@ 
jobeinc.com or mail 
to or drop off at any 
Jobe Publishing 
office.
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